
BOARD OF EDUCATION 
OF THE 

OAKLAND UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT 
 

Resolution No. 2425-0243 
 

Repealing - Resolution No. 2425-0084 - Directing Alternative Budget Adjustments For 
SY 24-25, 25-26 & 26-27 (Legislative File Id 25-0492, Enactment No. 25-0600, March 26, 
2025) 

 
WHEREAS, the Board of Education (hereinafter “Board”) engages in a yearly budget 
adjustments process. Since 2023 the adjustments have been called “Attachments”. In 2023 the 
Board approved Attachment A, in 2024 the Board approved Attachment B, and this year the 
Board approved Attachment C, 

 
WHEREAS, on February 26, 2025 the Board approved the Notice of layoffs for classified 
employees and to eliminate certificated positions. These change in work force votes were the 
final step in approving Attachment C, 

 
WHEREAS, Resolution No. 2425-0084 - Directing Alternative Budget Adjustments for SY 24-
25, 25-26 & 26-27 (Legislative File No. 25-0492) (hereinafter Resolution No. 2425-0084) was 
on February 26, 2025 introduced as a New Legislative Matter, on March 6, 2025 considered 
and recommended favorably (for adoption) to the Board by the Budget and Finance 
Committee, on March 26, 2025 adopted As Amended by the Board at its Regular Meeting, on 
March 27, 2025 Stayed By the County Fiscal Trustee and on April 8, 2025 the Stay was lifted 
by the County Fiscal Trustee, 
 
WHEREAS, with Resolution No. 2425-0084 effective, the Superintendent and the Chief 
Business Officer implemented Resolution No. 2425-0084 including giving Notice to impacted 
Parties thereof,  
 
WHEREAS, the Board and/or individual Board Members have received testimony from 
constituents in Public Meetings, verbal and written communications that Resolution 2425-
0084 is having and/or will have negative, unintended consequences upon educational 
programs for School Year 2025-26 and subsequent fiscal years, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT, Resolution No. 2425-0084 (Legislative File Id  
25-0492, Enactment No. 25-0600, March 26, 2025) shall be and hereby is repealed. 
 
Passed by the following vote:  
 
PREFERENTIAL AYE: None 
 
PREFERENTIAL NOE: None 
 
PREFERENTIAL ABSTENTION: None  
 



PREFERENTIAL RECUSED: None 
 

  AYES:           Rachel Latta, VanCedric Williams, Vice President Valarie Bachelor, President Jennifer  
                        Brouhard 
 
  NOES:           None 
 
  ABSTAINED: Mike Hutchinson 
 
  RECUSED:    None 
 
  ABSENT:      Patrice Berry, Clifford Thompson, Maximus Simmons (Student Director), Michele Vasquez  
                       (Student Director) 

CERTIFICATION 
 

  We hereby certify that the foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of a Resolution passed at a 
   Special Meeting of the Board of Education of the Oakland Unified School District held on May 21, 
   2025. 

OAKLAND UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT 
 
 

 
Jennifer Brouhard 
President, Board of Education 

 
 

 
Kyla Johnson-Trammell 
Superintendent and Secretary, Board of Education 
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